
 MINUTES FROM A REGULAR MEETING OF THE 
COUNCIL OF MUSCLE SHOALS, ALABAMA, HELD

May 16, 2005
_____________________________________________________________________________ 

The Council of Muscle Shoals, Alabama met at the Muscle Shoals City Hall in said City
at 6:30 p.m. on the 16th  day of May 2005 being the regularly scheduled time and approved place
for said meeting.  The meeting was called to order by David Bradford, Mayor of the City.  The
invocation was given by Robert Evans.  On roll call the following members were found to be
present or absent, as indicated: 

PRESENT: JOE PAMPINTO, NEAL WILLIS, JERRY KNIGHT GRISSOM 
JAMES  HOLLAND, ALLEN NOLES, DAVID H. BRADFORD

ABSENT: NONE

Richard Williams, City Clerk of the City, was present and kept the minutes of the
meeting.

David Bradford, Mayor of the City, presided at the meeting and declared that a quorum
was present and that the meeting was convened and opened for the purposes of transaction of
business.

Upon motion duly made by Council Member Holland, seconded by Council Member
Grissom and unanimously adopted, the Council waived the reading of the minutes of the
previously held regular meeting of May 2, 2005 and approved the minutes as written.

Mayor Bradford announced that the next item of business was consideration of a
resolution awarding a bid for tee shirts for the Recreation Department. 

Council Member Grissom thereupon introduced the following resolution and moved for
its adoption which was presented in the meeting:
STATE OF ALABAMA
COLBERT COUNTY

RESOLUTION NUMBER   2133-05

BE IT RESOLVED, by the Council of the City of Muscle Shoals, Alabama as follows:
[1] That the Purchasing Agent did send out advertisements for bids for the purchase 

of tee-shirts, the bid opening being held May 9, 2005 at the City Hall of the City of Muscle
Shoals, Alabama.

[2] At the appointed time and place, as specified above, the following bids were 
opened and tabulated as follows:  



STYLE SHIRT SHIRT OPTION: Price/shirt:
ESP

Price/shirt:
IMAGES 2

STYLE A: (1) 1 color front & back 3.50 2.75

(2) 1 color front & 2 color back 3.75 2.75

(3) 1 color front & 3 color back 4.00 2.80

(4) 1 color front & 4 color back no bid 2.80

(5) 1 color front & 5 color back no bid 2.90

(6) 1 color front & 6 color back no bid 2.90

STYLE B: (1) 2 color front & back 4.00 2.80

(2) 3 color front & back 4.50 2.90

(3) 4 color front & back no bid 2.90

(4) 5 color front & back no bid 2.99

(5) 6 color front & back no bid 2.99

STYLE C: (1) 3 color front & 2 color back 4.25 2.90

(2) 3 color front & 4 color back no bid 2.90

(3) 3 color front & 5 color back no bid 2.90

(4) 3 color front & 6 color back no bid 2.99

STYLE D: (1) 4 color front & 2 color back no bid 2.90

(2) 4 color front & 3 color back no bid 2.90

(3) 4 color front & 5 color back no bid 2.99

(4) 4 color front & 6 color back no bid 2.99

[3] The lowest, responsive, responsible, bidder after evaluation and verifying the bid with
the specifications, has  been determined as Images 2 with a bid  price of $2.99 per shirt for Style
B - Option 5 (6 color logo on front and 6 color logo on back), and Style D - Option 4 (4 color
logo on front and 6 color logo on back).

The apparent low and best bidder, Images 2,  is now awarded the bid for the purchase of
tee-shirts, specifically, Style B - Option 5, and Style D - Option 4.

 _______________________________
Council Member Noles seconded the motion and upon said motion being put to a vote, all

voted “AYE” and “NAYS” were none.
Mayor Bradford announced that the Resolution had been approved.



Mayor Bradford announced that the next item of business was consideration of a
resolution awarding a bid for gasoline. 

Council Member Noles thereupon introduced the following resolution and moved for its
adoption which was presented in the meeting:
STATE OF ALABAMA
COLBERT COUNTY

RESOLUTION NUMBER   2134-05

BE IT RESOLVED, by the Council of the City of Muscle Shoals, Alabama as follows:
[1] That the Purchasing Agent did send out advertisements for bids for the purchase 

of gasoline, the bid opening being held May 16, 2005 at the City Hall of the City of Muscle
Shoals, Alabama.

[2] At the appointed time and place, as specified above, the following bids were 
opened and tabulated as follows:  

BIDDER: GASOLINE:
Per Gallon:

O’Steen Oil Company $1.485
Tatum Oil Company $1.505

[3] The lowest, responsive, responsible, bidder after evaluation and verifying the bid with
the specifications, has  been determined as O’Steen Oil Company  with a bid  price of $1.485 for
the purchase of gasoline. 

The apparent low and best bidder, O’Steen Oil Company is now awarded the bid for
gasoline.

 _______________________________
Council Member Willis seconded the motion and upon said motion being put to a vote,

all voted “AYE” and “NAYS” were none.
Mayor Bradford announced that the Resolution had been approved.

Mayor Bradford announced that the next item of business was consideration of a
resolution declaring the week of May 15, 2005 as the Week of Peace. 

Council Member Willis thereupon introduced the following resolution and moved for its
adoption which was presented in the meeting:
STATE OF ALABAMA
COLBERT COUNTY

RESOLUTION NUMBER   2135 - 05
TO PROCLAIM  MAY 15-21, 2005

AS AN OFFICIAL WEEK OF PEACE
IN THE CITY OF MUSCLE SHOALS, ALABAMA



WHEREAS, the Bible and our historical roots instruct us to be a people of peace and to
assist others who are in conflict; and

WHEREAS, when in conflict, we are responsible for our own contribution to the
situation and for cooperating in a peaceable solution; and

WHEREAS, instead of pretending that conflict doesn’t exist or talking about others
behind their backs, we can overlook minor offenses or talk personally and graciously with those
whose offenses are more serious; and

WHEREAS, instead of accepting premature compromise or allowing relationships to
wither, we wish to actively pursue genuine peace and reconciliation and practice true
forgiveness; and

WHEREAS, on May 20 and 21 in Florence, Peacemaker Ministries will be leading a
special event at Heritage Christian University to instruct us how to live at peace with one
another.

THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that the City of Muscle Shoals, Alabama,
recognizes this as an official Week of Peace and encourages peaceful resolution to any conflict
that may exist, whether domestic or civil.

_______________________________
Council Member Pampinto seconded the motion and upon said motion being put to a

vote, all voted “AYE” and “NAYS” were none.
Mayor Bradford announced that the Resolution had been approved.

Mayor Bradford announced that the next item of business was consideration of a
resolution authorizing the Mayor to execute an agreement with the Northwest Alabama Council
of Local Governments to provide technical assistance to update and amend the City’s subdivision
regulations.   

Council Member Holland thereupon introduced the following resolution and moved for
its adoption which was presented in the meeting:
STATE OF ALABAMA
COLBERT COUNTY

RESOLUTION NUMBER  2136-05

RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING THE NORTHWEST ALABAMA
COUNCIL OF LOCAL GOVERNMENTS TO PROVIDE TECHNICAL 

SERVICES TO UPDATE AND AMEND THE SUBDIVISION 
REGULATIONS OF THE CITY OF MUSCLE SHOALS

WHEREAS, the City of Muscle Shoals is desirous of updating and amending the
existing subdivision regulations of the City, and

WHEREAS, the Northwest Alabama Council of Local Governments has the necessary
technical expertise to assist in the updating and amending of the subdivision regulations, now



THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, that the City Council of the City of Muscle Shoals
authorizes the Mayor to enter into a contract with the Northwest Alabama Council of Local
Governments to provide technical services for this project for a fee not to exceed $6,000.

_______________________________
Council Member Grissom seconded the motion and upon said motion being put to a vote,

all voted “AYE” and “NAYS” were none.
Mayor Bradford announced that the Resolution had been approved.

Mayor Bradford announced that the next item of business was consideration of a
resolution authorizing the Mayor to execute an agreement with the Northwest Alabama Council
of Local Governments to provide administrative services for the EPA 2005 Special
Appropriations grant. 

Council Member Pampinto thereupon introduced the following resolution and moved for
its adoption which was presented in the meeting:
STATE OF ALABAMA
COLBERT COUNTY

RESOLUTION NUMBER  2137  - 05

RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING THE NORTHWEST ALABAMA
COUNCIL OF LOCAL GOVERNMENTS TO ADMINISTER
EPA 2005 SPECIAL APPROPRIATIONS GRANT FOR THE 

NORTHWEST ALABAMA REGIONAL AIRPORT  INDUSTRIAL PARK –
WATER/WASTEWATER INFRASTRUCTURE

WHEREAS, the City of Muscle Shoals has received notification that it is receiving EPA
2005 Special Appropriations funding to construct water and wastewater infrastructure
improvements in the Northwest Alabama Regional  Airport Industrial Park, and

WHEREAS, the City of Muscle Shoals desires to expedite this project as soon as
possible to promote employment opportunities for the City of Muscle Shoals, and the entire
Muscle Shoals Community, now

THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, that the City Council of the City of Muscle Shoals
authorizes the Mayor to enter into a contract with the Northwest Alabama Council of Local
Governments to provide administrative services for this project for a fee not to exceed $28,000.

_______________________________
Council Member Holland seconded the motion and upon said motion being put to a vote,

all voted “AYE” and “NAYS” were none.
Mayor Bradford announced that the Resolution had been approved.



There being no further business to come before the meeting, upon the motion duly made
and approved the meeting was adjourned.

CITY OF MUSCLE SHOALS, ALABAMA   
a Municipal Corporation

_________________________________________
MAYOR

_________________________________________
COUNCIL MEMBER  - PLACE ONE

_________________________________________
COUNCIL MEMBER  - PLACE TWO

_________________________________________
COUNCIL MEMBER  - PLACE THREE

_________________________________________
COUNCIL MEMBER  - PLACE FOUR

_________________________________________
COUNCIL MEMBER  - PLACE FIVE

ATTEST:

_____________________________
CITY CLERK
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